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Steven Brown, Deputy Director of Public Health (Devon County Council)

Steve has worked in public health for over twenty years, occupying a number of senior 
positions within the NHS and the Local Authority, including Acting Director of Public Health 
and Deputy Director of Public Health.  He has a Degree in Sport and Leisure; a Master’s in 
Public Health and is a Fellow of the Faculty of Public Health.  In his current role he leads on 
the commissioning of public health services and programmes for Devon County Council. 
  He recently led the commissioning of a new Healthy Lifestyle Service for Devon which has 
been cited as an example of innovative commissioning by the Local Government 
Association.  

Jamie Hulland, Transport Planning and Road Safety Manager (Devon County Council)

In 2009 Jamie re-joined Devon County Council in a management role, having spent his early 
career with the County and subsequently as a Senior and Principal consultant role with 
Faber Maunsell (now AECOM). He has responsibility for developing transport strategies 
linked to Local Plan growth across Devon and is supported by a team of transport planners 
with economic appraisal skills who prepare business cases for strategic transport 
infrastructure projects. 

Since 2013, his team has enjoyed success in securing over £40m of capital grant funding to 
help deliver over £80m of cycle, rail and highway infrastructure improvements (excluding the 
£110m South Devon Highway). Complementing this, the team has recently secured £1.5m 
revenue funding to help promote and encourage increased levels of walking and cycling 
across the County.

Jamie is on the ADEPT Transportation Board, is a chartered town planner and was the CIHT 
South West Region Chair in 2015/16. 

James Bogue, Senior Development Manager, Active Devon

James has 13 years experience in the sport & physical activity sector and is a Senior 
Development Manager with Active Devon, the County Sport & Physical Activity Partnership. 
He leads the East Area team and is the organisational lead for Children & Young People, 
Active Workplaces and Active Travel.

Since 2012, James has chaired the local Active Exeter group helping to realise the ambition 
for Exeter to become the most active city in the south west by 2018.

James has been involved in voluntary capacity developing local community sport for 15 
years, including being a current active member of the Devon Cricket Board and also a 
founding member of the Exeter Riverside parkrun.



Sue Goodfellow, Chair of Natural Devon 

Sue has been Chair of Natural Devon – the Devon LNP (www.naturaldevon.org.uk ) since 
May 2013. The LNP Board includes the Director of Public Health Devon, as well as 
representatives of local authorities, universities, schools, farming and business interests, 
community and environmental NGOs and Defra. Sue also represents LNPs regionally on the 
Heart of the South West LEP ESIF Committee and Rural Interest Group; and nationally on 
Defra’s stakeholder group for biodiversity. 

Sue worked for the Dartmoor National Park Authority for over 30 years, latterly as Director of 
Park Management and Director of Conservation. She had overall responsibility for delivering 
the Authority’s programmes for tourism, recreation, visitor centres, ranger services, farming, 
forestry, nature conservation, etc. Sue now runs an environmental consultancy focusing on 
sustainable tourism, interpretation, ecological surveys, conservation advice, and protected 
area management. She is a professional Moorland Guide, a trustee of the Devon Wildlife 
Trust and a Director of Devon Wildlife Consulting.

Sue believes passionately in promoting the mutually beneficial relationships between people 
and nature and, in support of Natural Devon’s ‘Naturally Healthy’ theme, she has led cross-
sector workshops with care providers, Public Health Devon, NHS, Active Devon and Defra 
and contributed to regional and national forums. She lives in the Teign Valley on the edge of 
Dartmoor. 
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